
6 June:
Jeanno Gaussi (Berlin):
Collected fragments

19 June (Monday 6 pm):
Zoltán Biedermann (UCL)
Global history lecture

20 June:
Zoltán Biedermann (UCL)
Connection, (dis)connection, 
(dys)connection: do words 
matter in the writing of global 
history?

27 June:
Roii Ball (Münster) 
Dis:connecting kinship and 
empire: Swabian farming 
families and German imperial 
expansion, 1860-1920s

4 July: 
Yolanda Gutiérrez (Hamburg)
RE-shaping history through 
body, memory and sound (audio 
walk)

18 July: 
Arnab Dey (Binghamton) 
Invisibilities: global capital and 
the politics of occupational 
health in British India

Lunchtime
Colloquium
Summer Term,
23

18 April:
Kickoff and potluck lunch 

25 April:
Katarzyna Puzon (HU Berlin)
Listening to the world - 
sounding out the archives

2 May:
Andrea Frohne (Ohio) 
Free black and brown 
communities, the Ohio river 
and regional dis:connections

9 May: 
Camille Serchuk (Southern 
Connecticut State) 
Troubling boundaries: 
ornament and early modern 
cartography

16 May: 
Cathrine Bublatzky (Tübingen) 
Remembering from Iranian 
exile - photography, politics 
and everyday life

23 May: 
Katharina Wilkens (Leipzig) 
The formation of  ‘African’ 
religion and culture in African 
socialism

The colloquium takes place 
Tuesdays, 11.30-13.00 
at global dis:connect, a Käte 
Hamburger Research Centre
Maria-Theresia-Straße 21,
81675 Munich

Come dis:connect with us.
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